
QuARTz by ACO

Bulimba is one of Brisbane’s 
prestigious riverside suburbs known 
for its magnificent designer homes.

Recently, a three level home in 
Bulimba, comprising five bedrooms, 
three bathrooms, a lift, cinema and 
gymnasium, was totally renovated.

The home owner wanted a modern 
appearance for the bathrooms with 
large granite tiles from wall to ceiling, 
modern appliances and fittings along 
with level threshold bathroom floors 
without hobs or recesses.

The objective was to make the 
drainage elements in the wet areas 
as discreet as possible, so as not to 
detract from the appearance of the 
large granite tiles.

The owner and designer both chose 
ACO’s ShowerChannel with Tile grates 
in standard and custom lengths.

ShowerChannel is part of the 
QuARTz By ACO range comprising 
linear channels and floor wastes.

For more product information visit: 
www.quartzbyaco.com.au

Specifier: Builtex Homes

Product Featured: 
ShowerChannel with 
Tile grate

Other ACO Products Used: 
Linear drainage for balconies
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